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F-35/JSF OMNIBUS Basic Ordering Agreement Prime Contract 

Generated Using the 2019 Version of the Lockheed Martin CorpDocs 

Original: March 28, 2019 
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The Terms and Conditions listed below are incorporated by reference and made a part of this Contract. Unless 

otherwise limited in this Contract, each document applies in its entirety.   

In the event of a conflict between the version or date of a clause set forth in this document and the version or 

date of a clause set forth in the identified CorpDocs, the version or date of the clauses set forth in this document 

shall take precedence. 

To the extent that any clause included in this PSFD is inapplicable to the performance of this Contract, the Parties 

shall consider such clauses to be self-deleting and shall not impose any obligations upon the SELLER. 

PART I. DELETIONS: The following clauses are deleted in their entirety from the applicable CorpDocs 
incorporated into this Contract: 
 
RESERVED 
 
PART II. MODIFICATIONS: The 



http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=52.216-16&supp_id=1
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=52.239-1&supp_id=1
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=52.243-1%20ALT%20V&supp_id=1
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=52.243-2%20ALT%20I&supp_id=1
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=52.243-2%20ALT%20II&supp_id=1
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contained elsewhere in this Contract. If this information is not available, contact LOCKHEED MARTIN's 
procurement representative.) 
 
DFARS 252.225-7015 RESTRICTION ON ACQUISITION OF HAND OR MEASURING TOOLS (JUN 2005) 
(Applies to subcontracts that requires the delivery of hand or measuring tools.) 
 
DFARS 252.225-7027  RESTRICTION ON CONTINGENT FEES FOR FOREIGN MILITARY SALES (APR 
2003) (The reference to the clause in paragraph (a) means FAR 52.203-5. The blank in paragraph (b)(1) is 
completed with "any Government." Subparagraph (b)(2) is deleted.) 
 
DFARS 252.225-7028 EXCLUSIONARY POLICIES AND PRACTICES OF FOREIGN GOVERNMENTS (APR 
2003) (Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.225-7030 RESTRICTION ON ACQUISITION OF CARBON, ALLOY, AND ARMOR STEEL PLATE 
(DEC 2006) (Applies if this order is if for carbon, alloy, and armor steel plate in Federal supply class 9515, or 
described by American Society for Testing Materials (ASTM) or American Iron and Steel Institute (AISI) 
specifications. Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.228-7001 GROUND AND FLIGHT RISK (JUN 2010) (In paragraph (a)(1)(i), "this Contract" means 
"the prime contract." The following is added at the beginning of the clause: "Communications between SELLER 
and the Government shall be made through LOCKHEED MARTIN. Any equitable adjustment provided for this 
clause shall be implemented in this Contract to the extent such adjustment is implemented in the prime contract." 
Subparagraphs (d)(2)(ii), (d)(3)(ii), and the last sentence of subparagraph (j)(2) are deleted. Not applicable to 
commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.234-7002 EARNED VALUE MANAGEMENT SYSTEM (MAY 2011) (Applies if this is a Cost or 
Incentive contract equal to or greater than $20,000,000. "Government" means "LOCKHEED MARTIN and 
Government." Paragraphs (i) and (j) are deleted. Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.234-7004 COST AND SOFTWARE DATA REPORTING SYSTEM (NOV 2014) (Applies if contract 
value is greater than $50 million. In paragraph (b), "Government" means LOCKHEED MARTIN. Not applicable 
to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.234-7004 ALT I – ALTERNATE I – COST AND SOFTWARE DATA REPORTING SYSTEM (NOV 
2014) (Applies if contract value is greater than $50 million. In paragraph (b), "Government" means LOCKHEED 
MARTIN. Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.239-7001 INFORMATION ASSURANCE CONTRACTOR TRAINING AND CERTIFICATION (JAN 
2008) (ñContractorò shall mean ñSELLERò in this clause.) 
 
DFARS 252.239-7016 TELECOMMUNICATIONS SECURITY EQUIPMENT, DEVICES, TECHNIQUES, AND 
SERVICES (DEC 1991) (Applies if this Contract requires securing telecommunications. Not applicable to 
commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.243-7002 REQUESTS FOR EQUITABLE ADJUSTMENT (DEC 2012) ("Government" means 
"LOCKHEED MARTIN." Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 2.101.) 
 
DFARS 252.244-7000 SUBCONTRACTS FOR COMMERCIAL ITEMS (JUN 2013) 
 
DFARS 252.245-7001 TAGGING, LABELING, AND MARKING OF GOVERNMENT-FURNISHED PROPERTY 

(APR 2012) (Applies to subcontracts where the items furnished by the subcontractor will be subject to serialized 

tracking.) 

http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.225-7015&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.225-7027&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.225-7028&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.228-7001&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.234-7002&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.234-7004&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.234-7004%20ALT%20I&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.239-7016&supp_id=6
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=252.243-7002&supp_id=6
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 (2) Contract Number/Delivery/Task order number.  

 (3) Contract/Delivery/Task order dollar amount.  

 (4) Whether the Contract was competitively or non-competitively awarded.  

 (5) Name of sponsoring individual.  

 (6) Name and address of requiring activity. 

NAVAIR 5252.247-9508 PROHIBITED PACKING MATERIALS (JUN 1998) (Applies if SELLER will make 
shipments under this Contract directly to the Government. Not applicable to commercial items as defined by FAR 
2.101.) 

The use of asbestos, excelsior, newspaper or shredded paper (all types including waxed paper, computer paper 
and similar hydroscopic or non-neutral material) is prohibited. In addition, loose fill polystyrene is prohibited for 
shipboard use. 

NAVAIR 5252.247-9510 PRESERVATION, PACKAGING, PACKING, AND MARKING FOR FOREIGN 
MILITARY SALES (FMS) REQUIREMENTS (OCT 2005) (Applies if SELLER will make shipments under this 
Contract directly to the Government.) 

(a) Unless specified elsewhere in the Contract, packing and packaging shall comply with MIL-STD-129. Packing 
and packaging materials shall provide protection from abuse during handling and from environmental, magnetic, 
and electrical damage during handling and subsequent future storage, possibly under less than desirable 
conditions. 

(b) Marking: All unit and exterior containers/packs sh

http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=5252.247-9508&supp_id=15
http://flag.global.lmco.com/flag/search/dspGuidance.cfm?dsply_rfrnc_code=5252.247-9510&supp_id=15
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Information, whether delivered pursuant to the  Supplier Data Requirements List (SDRL) or provided in response 

to any other requirement contained in this Contract, which would be deemed ñtechnical dataò under DFARS 

252.227.7013 RIGHTS IN TECHNICAL DATA ï NONCOMMERCIAL ITEMS (FEB 2014), or ñcomputer softwareò 

and ñcomputer software documentationò under DFARS 252.227-7014 RIGHTS IN NONCOMMERCIAL 

COMPUTER SOFTWARE AND NONCOMMERCIAL COMPUTER SOFTWARE DOCUMENTATION (FEB 

2014), if it were delivered in written form, shall not lose its status as technical data, computer software, or 

computer software documentation solely because access by the Government or LOCKHEED MARTIN, delivery 

by the SELLER, or provision by the SELLER is by electronic means. The rights of the Parties shall be as specified 

in DFARS 252.227-7013 and DFARS 252.227-7014. 

 
H-8 – NAVAIR 5252.227-9505 TECHNICAL DATA AND COMPUTER SOFTWARE IDENTIFICATION IN 
ENGINEERING CHANGE PROPOSALS (ECP’s) (AUG 1987) (VARIATION) 
 

Each Engineering Change Proposal (ECP) submitted by the SELLER shall identify each item of technical data 

and computer software delivered by the SELLER under any prior Government contract required to be revised as 

a result of the proposed change and shall include an estimated price and cost proposal to furnish the revisions. 

 
H-10 – NAVAIR 5252.204-9504 DISCLOSURE OF CONTRACT INFORMATION (JAN 2007) (VARIATION) 
 
(a) The SELLER shall not release to anyone outside the SELLERôs organization any information (e.g., 
announcement of Contact award), regardless of medium (e.g., film, tape, document, etc.), pertaining to any part 
of this Contract or any effort directly related to the F-35 Lightning II Joint Strike Fighter (JSF) Program unlessð 

(1) The F-35 Joint Program Office (JPO) has given prior written approval through LOCKHEED MARTIN;  

(2) The information is otherwise in the public domain before the date of release; or 

(3) The information is being released to associate contractors, subcontractors, suppliers, or vendors who require 
the information for execution of work under an F-35 Lightning II JSF contract. 

(b) Requests for approval shall identify the specific information to be released, the medium to be used, and the 
purpose for the release. ñInformationò includes, but is not limited to, news releases, articles, manuscripts, 
brochures, advertisements, still and motion pictures, speeches, trade association meetings, symposia, and 
professional papers to be published. The SELLER shall submit the original and 1 copy of the information 
proposed for release to the JSFPO, through LOCKHEED MARTIN. 

Where practicable, requests and the specific information may be provided to the Public Affairs Officer through 
LOCKHEED MARTIN using an electronic medium appropriate for the security level of the information being 
transmitted. The SELLER shall submit its request to the Public Affairs Officer at least fifteen (15) working days 
before the proposed date for release. 

(c) The SELLER shall include a statement indicating the project or effort depicted was or is sponsored by: 

F-35 Joint Program Office 
Arlington, VA 22202 

(d) The SELLER agrees to include a similar requirement in each subcontract or purchase order under this 
C
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or independent verification and validations of technical documents submitted to the Government during 

performance. 

(b) The use of an ISC is solely for the convenience of the Government.  Except as otherwise provided by separate 

agreement between the ISC and SELLER, the ISC has no obligation to SELLER. SELLER is required to provide 


